
American Recovery and Reinvestment Act of 2009 (ARRA) 
 Terms and Conditions 
 

Required State and Federal Contract Certifications and Representations 

 

Representation Regarding Any Conflict of Interest 

Contractor agrees to comply with Section 25-4-101, et sec., of the Mississippi Code 1972 Annotated, which references 
prohibitions against conflicting party interests.   
 
Representation Regarding Contingent Fees 
 
The Contractor represents that it has not retained a person to solicit or secure a contract upon an agreement or 
understanding for a commission, percentage, brokerage, or contingent fee, except as disclosed in the contractor’s bid or 
proposal. 
 
Representation Regarding Gratuities 
 
The Contractor represents that it has not violated, is not violating, and promises that it will not violate the prohibition 
against gratuities set forth in Section 7-204 (Gratuities) of the Mississippi Personal Service Contract Procurement 
Regulations. 
 
Certification of Independent Price Determination 
 
The Contractor certifies that the prices submitted in response to the solicitation have been arrived at independently and 
without-for the purpose of restricting competition – any consultation, communication, or agreement with any other bidder 
or competitor relating to those prices, the intention to submit a bid, or the methods or factors used to calculate the prices 
bid. 
 
Laws 
 
The contract shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of the State of Mississippi, excluding its 
conflicts of law’s provisions, and any litigation with respect thereto shall be brought in the courts of the State.  The 
Contractor shall comply with, and all activities under this agreement shall be subject to, all applicable federal, State of 
Mississippi, and local laws and regulations, as now existing and as may be amended or modified.   
 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Federal ARRA related contract/sub-recipient terms: 

 E-Verification  

The Contractor represents and warrants that it will ensure its compliance with the Mississippi Employment Protection Act 
(Senate Bill 2988 from the 2008 Regular Legislative Session) and will register and participate in the status verification 
system for all newly hired employees.  The term “employee” as used herein means any person that is hired to perform 
work within the State of Mississippi.  As used herein, “status verification system” means the Illegal Immigration Reform 
and Immigration Responsibility Act of 1996 that is operated by the United States Department of Homeland Security, also 
known as the E-Verify Program, or any other successor electronic verification system replacing the E-Verify Program.  
Contractor agrees to maintain records of such compliance and, upon request of the State, to provide a copy of each such 
verification to the State.  Contractor further represents and warrants that any person assigned to perform services 
hereunder meets the employment eligibility requirements of all immigration laws of the State of Mississippi.  Contractor 
understands and agrees that any breach of these warranties may subject contractor to the following:   

(a) termination of this Agreement and ineligibility for any State or public contract in Mississippi for up to three (3) years 
with notice of such cancellation/termination being made public;  

(b) the loss of any license, permit, certification, or other document granted to contractor by an agency, department or 
governmental entity for the right to do business in Mississippi for up to one (1) year or  

(c) both.   In the event of such termination/cancellation, contractor would also be liable for any additional costs incurred 
by the State due to contract cancellation or loss of license or permit.  

 Whistleblower Protection  

Section 1553 of Division A, Title XV of the American Recovery and Reinvestment Act of 2009, P.L. 111-5, provides 
protections for certain individuals who make specified disclosures relating to Recovery Act funds. Any non-federal 
employer receiving recovery funds is required to post a notice of the rights and remedies provided under this section of 
the Act. 

 Reporting Requirements  

The bidder is notified that this project will be financed with American Recovery and Reinvestment Act of 2009 
(hereinafter, “ARRA”) Funds.   The contractor shall ensure that all subcontracts and other contracts for goods and services 
for an ARRA-funded project have the mandated provisions of this directive in their contracts.  Pursuant to Title XV, 
Section 1512 of the ARRA, the State shall require that the contractor provide reports and other employment information 
as evidence to document the number of jobs created or jobs retained by this contract from the contractor’s own workforce 
and any sub-contractors.  No direct payment will be made for providing said reports, as the cost for same shall be included 
in the various items in the contract.  

 

 Required Contract Provision to Implement ARRA Section 902  

Section 902 of the ARRA requires that each contract awarded using ARRA funds must include a provision that provides 
the U.S. Comptroller General and his representatives with the authority to:  

 (1)  Examine any records of the contractor or any of its subcontractors, or any State or local agency administering such 
contract, that directly pertain to, and involve transactions relating to, the contract or subcontract; and 

 (2)  Interview any officer or employee of the contractor or any of its subcontractors, or of any State or local government 
agency administering the contract, regarding such transactions. 



 Accordingly, the Comptroller General and his representatives shall have the authority and rights prescribed under Section 
902 of the ARRA with respect to contracts funded with recovery funds made available under the ARRA.  Section 902 
further states that nothing in 902 shall be interpreted to limit or restrict in any way any existing authority of the 
Comptroller General. 

Authority of the Inspector General Provision  

Section 1515(a) of the ARRA provides authority for any representatives of the United States Inspector General to examine 
any records or interview any employee or officers working on this contract.   The contractor is advised that representatives 
of the Inspector General have the authority to examine any record and interview any employee or officer of the contractor, 
its subcontractors or other firms working on this contract.   Section 1515(b) further provides that nothing in this section 
shall be interpreted to limit or restrict in any way any existing authority of an Inspector General.  

 Buy American Provision  

Construction, Renovation, and Remodeling Projects Only—Not Division B Programs 

Section 1605 of the ARRA requires that iron, steel and manufactured goods used in public buildings or public works 
projects be manufactured in the United States. contractor agrees to abide by this provision and shall maintain records of 
such purchases for inspections by authorized agents of the State of Mississippi and federal agencies.   The contractor must 
obtain written exception from this provision from the agency issuing the contract. 

 Wage Rate Provision (Davis-Bacon)  

Construction, Renovation, and Remodeling Projects Only—Includes QSCBs and other Division B Bond Programs 

Section 1606 of the ARRA requires that all laborers and mechanics employed by contractors and subcontractors with 
funds from the ARRA shall be paid wages at rates not less than the prevailing wage rate under the Davis-Bacon Act.  The 
contractor agrees that by the submission of a proposal in response to a solicitation funded in whole or in part with 
recovery funds, continuous compliance will be maintained with the Davis-Bacon Act.  

NEPA and NHPA   

Construction, Renovation, and Remodeling Projects Only 

ARRA funded projects may be required to comply with the National Environmental Policy Act (NEPA), the National 
Historic Preservation Act (NHPA), and related statutes, including requirements for plans and projects to be reviewed and 
documented in accordance with those processes.  If the ARRA program from which funds are to be expended requires 
such language, then NEPA  and NHPA requirements may need to be included in contracts or sub-grants.  Such language 
would be dependent on federal oversight agency guidance as well as from the following:  
http://nepa.gov/nepa/regs/CEQ_1609_NEPA_Guidance_03-12.pdf (NEPA only) 

 Availability of Funds and Use of Funds 

Contractors understand and acknowledge that any and all payment of funds or the continuation thereof is contingent upon 
funds provided solely by ARRA or required state matching funds.  If the funds anticipated for the continuing fulfillment 
of the agreement are, at anytime, not forthcoming or insufficient, either through the failure of the federal government to 
provide funds or of the State of Mississippi to appropriate funds or the discontinuance or material alteration of the 
program under which funds were provided or if funds are not otherwise available to the MDE, the MDE shall have the 
right upon ten (10) working days written notice to the Contractor, to terminate this agreement without damage, penalty, 
cost or expenses to the state of any kind whatsoever.  The effective date of termination shall be as specified in the notice 
of termination.   

 



Prohibition on Use of ARRA Funds 

Pursuant to Section 1604 of the ARRA, contractors agree not to undertake or make progress toward any activity using 
recovery funds that will lead to the development of such activity as casinos or other gambling establishments, aquariums, 
zoos, golf courses, swimming pools or any other activity specifically prohibited by the Recovery Act.  

Federal, State and Local Tax Obligations  

By submission of a proposal, contractors and subcontractors assert and self-certify that all Federal, State and local tax 
obligations have been or will be satisfied prior to receiving recovery funds. 

 Anti-Discrimination and Equal Opportunity  

Pursuant to Section 1.7 of the guidance memorandum issued by the United States Office of Management and Budget on 
April 3, 2009, ARRA Recovery funds must be distributed in accordance with all anti-discrimination and equal opportunity 
statutes, regulations, and Executive Orders pertaining to the expenditure of funds.  

Access to Records and Other Issues 

Contractor agrees that the Mississippi Office of State Auditor (pursuant to Section 7-7-81, Mississippi Code 1972 
Annotated) shall have access to ARRA records and employee information as necessary to conduct audits related ARRA 
oversight. 

OTHER 

The contractor agrees to comply with all applicable requirements of the American Recovery and Reinvestment Act 
(ARRA) of 2009 and related regulations including, but not limited to, those outlined in Exhibit 1 that are attached hereto 
and incorporated herewith.  

 

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  



 



	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  

	
  



	
  



 



 



	
  



	
  


